
Cropwell Bishop Primary School: Our EYFS Aims and Principles    

 

 

  

Aims 
 

Principles  Key actions to achieve these 

To introduce our school core values of 

Pride, Kindness, Perseverance and 

Respect. 

To develop a child’s independence and 

sense of self, through a nurturing and 

valuing environment. 

To develop a sense of team, modelled by 

the staff and valuing each pupil’s role in 

our setting. 

To develop an awareness and 

understanding of ‘others’, appreciating 

the needs and beliefs of individuals. 

To spark a ‘love of learning’ and fuel the 

children with knowledge and skills which 

will be built upon and flourish 

throughout their educational journey. 

To ensure all pupils leave with a base of 

core knowledge and skills surrounding 

communication, language, literacy and 

mathematics.  

 

Learning is exciting and is to be enjoyed by all. 

All children should be inspired and supported to 
make educational risks, safe in the knowledge that 
they will always be valued. 

Parent’s and carer’s contributions and voice are 
integral to the welfare and development of each 
pupil. 

Children will have the opportunity to engage in a 
balance of child lead and adult lead activities and 
experiences through a rage of high-quality provision. 

Our high-quality interactions with the children are 
always valued as opportunities to push thinking, 
promote interpersonal skills and develop 
communication and language.  

 

Our staff team embody early learning role models 
who share the children’s enthusiasm whilst using 
their extensive expertise to scaffold and learning and 
promote our core values. 

Through a carefully constructed and progressive 
curriculum the children will develop skills and 
acquire knowledge to achieve the goals across all 
areas of learning. 

Our curriculum is tailored to the knowledge and 
skills our children have in relation to our 
demographic and setting. We also strive to provide 
learning opportunities to help develop the children 
into well rounded, knowledgeable and valuing 
learners and members of the wider community. 

Provision is of high quality and supports learning 
development opportunities in both indoor and 
outdoor settings.  

Communication through our Tapestry App values 
both school and home learning. In addition to 
providing high quality support material to parents to 
further support home learning.  


